Annual Water System Maintenance Parts Supply 2019

Arizona Water Works (Tempe)

Core & Main (Prescott)

Dana Kepner (LHC)

Ferguson Waterworks (Phoenix)

Fortline Waterworks (Peoria)

Line # Part Class Description Unit of Measure N;f:elro Quote Price Extended Price Availability
A1 BRASS ANGLE BALL VALVE 3/4" (single service stop) 1" CTS PJ W/ SWIVEL EA 1 70.81 $ 70.81 7-10 days
A2 BRASS ANGLE BALL VALVE W/ SWIVEL NUT X 1" CTS PJ (single service stop) EA 10 93.60 [ $ 936.00) 7-10 days
A3 BRASS ANGLE BALL VALVE 1" FIP X SWIVEL NUT (single service stop) H6 EA 4 85.50 | $ 342.00) 7-10 days
Ad BRASS BALL VALVE CURB STOP 1" (INLINE STOP) EA 200 8183 $ 16,366.00! 7-10 days
A5 BRASS BALL VALVE CURB STOP 2" (INLINE STOP) EA 1 275.26 | § 275.26] 7-10 days
A6 BRASS BUSHINGS 1/2" X 1/4" EA 1 285($ 2.85 7-10 days
A7 BRASS BUSHINGS 3/4" X 1/4" EA 1 541§ 5.41 7-10 days
A8 BRASS BUSHINGS 3/4" X 1/2" EA 1 541 (8% 5.41 7-10 days
A9 BRASS BUSHINGS 1" X 1/4" EA 1 7.03($ 7.03 7-10 days
A10 BRASS BUSHINGS 1" X 1/2" EA 1 6.15( $ 6.15 7-10 days
A1 BRASS BUSHINGS 1" X 3/4" EA 10 6.15( $ 61.50 7-10 days
A12 BRASS BUSHINGS 1 %" X 3/4" EA 1 1491 (§$ 14.91 7-10 days
A13 BRASS BUSHINGS 1 1/2" X 1" EA 1 1491 § 14.91 7-10 days
A4 BRASS BUSHINGS 2" X 3/4" EA 1 18.39 [ § 18.39 7-10 days
A15 BRASS BUSHINGS 2" X 1" EA 1 18.39 [ § 18.39 7-10 days
A16 BRASS BUSHINGS 2" X 1 %" EA 10 18.39 [ $ 183.90) 7-10 days
A7 BRASS BUSHINGS 2" X 1" (2"MIPT X 1" CC) EA 1 3730 | $ 37.30 7-10 days
A18 BRASS CAP 1/2" EA 5 334 ($ 16.70 7-10 days
A19 BRASS CAP 3/4" EA 10 420 % 42.00 7-10 days
A20 BRASS CAP 1" EA 10 762 (8% 76.20 7-10 days
A21 BRASS CHECK VALVE FIPT X FIPT 3/4" EA 50 2489 [ $ 1,244.50 7-10 days
A22 BRASS CHECK VALVE W/SWIVEL NUT X FIPT 3/4" EA 500 2597 [ $ 12,985.00! 7-10 days
A23 BRASS CHECK VALVE W/SWIVEL NUT 1" (DUAL CHECK VALVE) EA 1 99.43 [ § 99.43 7-10 days
A24 BRASS METER ADAPTER 1.5" TO 2" A67 PR 10 175.00 [ $ 1,750.00 7-10 days
A25 BRASS CORP STOP 1" I.P. EA 30 52.30 [ $ 1,569.00 7-10 days
A26 BRASS CORP STOP 1" C.C. EA 40 5230 $ 2,092.00 7-10 days
A27 BRASS CORP STOP 1 %" |.P. EA 10 11719 [ $ 1,171.90 7-10 days
A28 BRASS CORP STOP 2" I.P. EA 10 19383 [ $ 1,938.30 7-10 days
A29 BRASS COUPLING 1/2" FIPT X FIPT EA 1 420 % 4.20 7-10 days
A30 BRASS COUPLING 3/4" FIPT X FIPT EA 20 590 ($ 118.00) 7-10 days
A31 BRASS COUPLING 1" FIPT X FIPT EA 10 10.06 | $ 100.60] 7-10 days
A32 BRASS COUPLING 1 1/2" FIPT X FIPT EA 1 2184 ( $ 21.84 7-10 days
A33 BRASS COUPLING 2"  FIPT X FIPT EA 1 36.11 | $ 36.11 7-10 days
A34 BRASS COUPLING ADAPTER 3/4" MIPT X CTS PJ EA 10 1233 ( $ 123.30| 7-10 days
A35 BRASS COUPLING ADAPTER 3/4" MIPT X PVC PJ EA 1 16.32 ( § 16.32 7-10 days
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7453| § 74.53| Stock - 2 wks. 7224 $ 72.24 10 day ARO
9852  § 985.20( Stock - 2 wks. 9531 § 953.10 10 day ARO
89.99 [ § 359.96| Stock - 2 wks. 87.24 [ § 348.96| 10 day ARO
86.13 [ § 17,226.00| Stock - 2 wks. 83.07 [ $ 16,614.00| 15 day ARO
289.74 | § 289.74 Stock - 2 wks. 280.87 | $ 280.87 15 day ARO
476 | % 4.76| Stock - 2 wks. 440 % 4.40] 10 day ARO
555§ 5.55 3-4 weeks 513 $ 5.13| 10 day ARO
555| § 5.55 3-4 weeks 513§ 5.13| 10 day ARO
759 $ 7.59 3-4 weeks 7.01($ 7.01 10 day ARO
664 | $ 6.64] 3-4 weeks 6.13 [ § 6.13| 10 day ARO
664§ 66.40 3-4 weeks 6.13 | § 61.30| 10 day ARO
160.79 [ $ 160.79 3-4 weeks 14.86 | $ 14.86| 10 day ARO
160.79 | $ 160.79 3-4 weeks 14.86 | $ 14.86| 10 day ARO
1985 | $ 19.85 3-4 weeks 18.34  § 18.34] 10 day ARO
19.85| $ 19.85| 3-4 weeks 18.34 [ § 18.34| 10 day ARO
1985 | $ 198.50 3-4 weeks 1834 ( § 183.40 10 day ARO
39.25| § 39.25 3-4 weeks 38.05| $ 38.05 10 day ARO
360 | $ 18.00 3-4 weeks 333 (% 16.65| 10 day ARO
453 $ 45.30] 3-4 weeks 419§ 41.90| 10 day ARO
822 $ 82.20 3-4 weeks 760 [ $ 76.00| 10 day ARO
2619 | $ 1,309.50 Stock - 2 wks. 2534 § 1,267.00] 15 day ARO
2733 $ 13,665.00| Stock - 2 wks. 26.36 | $ 13,180.00] 15 day ARO
10465 [ $ 104.65| Stock - 2 wks. 10145 $ 101.45 15 day ARO
184.20  § 1,842.00( Stock - 2 wks. 17944 [ § 1,794.40 10 day ARO
5504 | $§ 1,651.20 Stock - 2 wks. 5325 | $ 1,597.50] 10 day ARO
55.04 | $ 2,201.60| Stock - 2 wks. 5325|$ 2,130.00 15 day ARO
12335 $ 1,233.50 Stock - 2 wks. 11933 [ § 1,193.30] 10 day ARO
204.02 | $ 2,040.20| Stock - 2 wks. 197.78 [ 1,977.80 10 day ARO
453§ 4.53] 3-4 weeks 418 | $ 4.18| 10 day ARO
636 | $ 127.20 3-4 weeks 589§ 117.80 10 day ARO
10.86 | $ 108.60 3-4 weeks 10.04 [ § 100.40 10 day ARO
2356 | $ 23.56 3-4 weeks 2178 § 21.78 10 day ARO
3898 | § 38.98 3-4 weeks 36.01| $ 36.01 10 day ARO
1297 | $ 129.70| Stock - 2 wks. 1255 ( § 125.50 10 day ARO
1717 $ 17.17| Stock - 2 wks. 16.64 [ § 16.64| 10 day ARO
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Annual Water System Maintenance Parts Supply 2019

Arizona Water Works (Tempe)

Core & Main (Prescott)

Dana Kepner (LHC)

Ferguson Waterworks (Phoenix)
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A36 BRASS COUPLING ADAPTER 1" FCT X CTS PJ (flaired copper tubing) EA 1 20.62 20.62 7-10 days
A37 BRASS COUPLING ADAPTER 1" MIPT X CTS PJ EA 1 14.60 14.60 7-10 days
A38 BRASS COUPLING ADAPTER 1" MIPT X PVC PJ EA 1 25.48 25.48 7-10 days
A39 BRASS COUPLING ADAPTER 1 1/2" MIPT X CTS PJ EA 10 39.98 399.80) 7-10 days
A40 BRASS COUPLING ADAPTER 1 1/2" MIPT X PVC PJ EA 1 50.09 50.09 7-10 days
Ad41 BRASS COUPLING ADAPTER 2" MIPT X CTS PJ EA 10 58.25 582.50) 7-10 days
A42 BRASS COUPLING ADAPTER 2" MIPT X PVC PJ EA 1 72.78 72.79 7-10 days
A43 BRASS COUPLING REPAIR 1" CTSPJX1"CTSPJ EA 40 17.17 686.80) 7-10 days
Ad4 BRASS COUPLING REPAIR 11/2" CTSPJX11/2"CTSPJ EA 1 57.45 57.44 7-10 days
A45 BRASS COUPLING REPAIR 2" CTSPJX2"CTSPJ EA 5 7754 387.70) 7-10 days
A46 BRASS ELL 1/2" 45 EA 1 6.17 6.17 7-10 days
A47 BRASS ELL 1/2" 90 EA 1 5.02 5.02 7-10 days
A48 BRASS ELL 3/4" 45 EA 1 8.76 8.7¢ 7-10 days
A49 BRASS ELL 3/4" 90 EA 50 6.71 335.50) 7-10 days
A50 BRASS ELL 1" 45 EA 1 14.95 14.95 7-10 days
A51 BRASS ELL 1" 90 EA 1 10.92 10.92 7-10 days
A52 BRASS ELL 11/2" 45 EA 1 29.88 29.88 7-10 days
A53 BRASS ELL 11/2" 90 EA 1 2184 21.84 7-10 days
A54 BRASS ELL 2" 45 EA 1 48.33 48.33 7-10 days
A55 BRASS ELL 2" 90 EA 1 35.25 35.25 7-10 days
A56 BRASS ELL ST 1/2" EA 1 6.71 6.71 7-10 days
A57 BRASS ELL ST 3/4" 90 EA 1 9.24 9.24 7-10 days
A58 BRASS ELLST 1" 90 EA 1 15.12 15.12 7-10 days
A59 BRASS ELL ST 11/2" EA 10 30.23 302.30) 7-10 days
AB0 BRASS ELL ST 2" 90 EA 20 51.23 1,024.60 7-10 days
A61 BRASS ELL 1"MIPT X 1"CTSPJ 90 EA 1 22.46 22.46 7-10 days
AB2 BRASS METER ADAPTER 5/8" X 3/4" A-23 EA 100 8.52 852.00) 7-10 days
A63 BRASS METER ADAPTER 3/4"X 1" A-34 (each is a pair) PR 40 15.68 627.20) 7-10 days
AB4 BRASS METER FLANGE ADAPTER 1 1/2" A-46  (each is a pair) PR 1 118.84 118.84 7-10 days
AB5 BRASS METER FLANGE ADAPTER 2" A-47  (each is a pair) PR 1 121.64 121.64 7-10 days
AB6 BRASS METER COUPLING 3/4" X 1.625" EA 50 8.01 400.50] 7-10 days
A67 BRASS METER COUPLING 3/4" X 2.5" EA 30 8.01 240.30) 7-10 days
AB8 BRASS METER COUPLING 3/4" X 3" EA 10 9.71 97.10) 7-10 days
A69 BRASS METER COUPLING 1" X 1.5" EA 1 11.98 11.98 7-10 days
A70 BRASS METER COUPLING 1" X 2.625" EA 1 12.33 12.33 7-10 days
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21.69 21.69 Stock - 2 wks. 21.03 21.03 15 day ARO
15.36 15.36| Stock - 2 wks. 14.89 14.89| 10 day ARO
25.76 25.76 Stock - 2 wks. 25.99 25.99 15 day ARO
42.07 420.70( Stock - 2 wks. 40.71 407.10 10 day ARO
52.72 52.72 Stock - 2 wks. 51.10 51.10| 10 day ARO
61.31 613.10( Stock - 2 wks. 59.31 593.10} 10 day ARO
76.60 76.60[ Stock - 2 wks. 74.26 74.26| 10 day ARO
18.06 722.40| Stock - 2 wks. 17.48 699.20 10 day ARO
60.46 60.46 Stock - 2 wks. 58.61 58.61 10 day ARO
81.61 408.05( Stock - 2 wks. 79.12 395.60| 10 day ARO

6.66 6.66) 3-4 weeks 6.15 6.15) 10 day ARO
5.42 5.42 3-4 weeks 5.01 5.01 10 day ARO
9.46 9.46 3-4 weeks 8.74 8.74 10 day ARO
7.24 362.00| 3-4 weeks 6.70 335.00 10 day ARO
16.13 16.13] 3-4 weeks 14.90 14.90| 10 day ARO
11.79 11.79| 3-4 weeks 10.89 10.89| 10 day ARO
32.25 32.25 3-4 weeks 29.79 29.79| 10 day ARO
23.58 23.58 3-4 weeks 21.78 21.78 10 day ARO
52.16 52.16 3-4 weeks 48.20 48.20| 10 day ARO
38.05 38.05 3-4 weeks 35.15 35.15| 10 day ARO
7.25 7.25] 3-4 weeks 6.70 6.70| 10 day ARO
9.98 9.98 3-4 weeks 9.22 9.22) 10 day ARO
16.32 16.32] 3-4 weeks 15.08 15.08| 10 day ARO
32.62 326.20, 3-4 weeks 30.15 301.50 10 day ARO
55.28 1,105.60 3-4 weeks 51.08 1,021.60] 10 day ARO
23.63 23.63 Stock - 2 wks. 2291 2291 10 day ARO
8.96 896.00( Stock - 2 wks. 8.67 867.00 15 day ARO
16.49 659.60( Stock - 2 wks. 15.96 638.40 15 day ARO
125.08 125.08| Stock - 2 wks. 121.26 121.26 10 day ARO
128.03 128.03| Stock - 2 wks. 124.11 124.11 10 day ARO
8.42 421.00( Stock - 2 wks. 8.15 407.50 10 day ARO
8.42 252.60( Stock - 2 wks. 8.15 244.50 10 day ARO
10.21 102.10| Stock - 2 wks. 9.88 98.80 10 day ARO
12.60 12.60| Stock - 2 wks. 12.21 12.21 10 day ARO
12.97 12.97| Stock - 2 wks. 12.57 12.57| 10 day ARO
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Annual Water System Maintenance Parts Supply 2019

Arizona Water Works (Tempe) Core & Main (Prescott) Dana Kepner (LHC) Ferguson Waterworks (Phoenix) Fortline Waterworks (Peoria)
Line # Part Class Description Unit of Measure N;f:elro Quote Price Extended Price Availability Quote Price Extended Price Availability Quote Price Extended Price Availability Quote Price Extended Price Availability Quote Price d Price A
A71 BRASS METER COUPLING 1" X 3.5" EA 1 $ 16.24 [ § 16.24 7-10 days $ 17.08 | $ 17.08| Stock - 2 wks. $ 16.56 [ $ 16.56 10 day ARO
A72 BRASS METER FLANGE 1 1/2" FIPT ELIPTICAL EA 10 $ 3563 ($ 356.30) 7-10 days $ 3749 | $ 374.90| Stock - 2 wks. $ 36.28 | $ 362.80| 10 day ARO
A73 BRASS METER FLANGE 2" FIPT ELIPTICAL EA 20 $ 4652 [ $ 930.40) 7-10 days $ 4896 | $ 979.20( Stock - 2 wks. $ 4737 | § 947.40 10 day ARO
A74 BRASS NIPPLE 1/2" X 2" EA 1 $ 162 $ 1.62 7-10 days $ 144 8 1.44 3-4 weeks $ 133 $ 1.33) 10 day ARO
A75 BRASS NIPPLE 1/2" X 4" EA 1 $ 296 $ 2.96 7-10 days $ 262§ 2.62 3-4 weeks $ 242 $ 2.42 10 day ARO
A76 BRASS NIPPLE 1/2" X 6" EA 1 $ 4318 4.31 7-10 days $ 381 $ 3.81 3-4 weeks $ 352 (% 3.52f 10 day ARO
AT7 BRASS NIPPLE 1/2" X CLOSE EA 1 $ 119 $ 1.19 7-10 days $ 1.06 | $ 1.06| 3-4 weeks $ 098 | $ 0.98] 10 day ARO
A78 BRASS NIPPLE 3/4" X 2" EA 20 $ 217 $ 43.40 7-10 days $ 192§ 38.40 3-4 weeks $ 178 | $ 35.60 10 day ARO
A79 BRASS NIPPLE 3/4" X 4" EA 1 $ 378 $ 3.79 7-10 days $ 334§ 3.34 3-4 weeks $ 3.09 [ $ 3.09 10 day ARO
A80 BRASS NIPPLE 3/4" X 6" EA 10 $ 552 (% 55.20 7-10 days $ 488 % 48.80| 3-4 weeks $ 452 | % 45.20| 10 day ARO
A81 BRASS NIPPLE 3/4" X CLOSE EA 1 $ 172 $ 1.72 7-10 days $ 152 | $ 1.52] 3-4 weeks $ 140 $ 1.40] 10 day ARO
A82 BRASS NIPPLE 1" X 2" EA 20 $ 313 ($ 62.60| 7-10 days $ 276 | $ 55.20 3-4 weeks $ 256 $ 51.20| 10 day ARO
A83 BRASS NIPPLE 1" X 4" EA 10 $ 547§ 54.70 7-10 days $ 484 $ 48.40| 3-4 weeks $ 448 | % 44.80| 10 day ARO
A84 BRASS NIPPLE 1" X 6" EA 10 $ 8.06 | $ 80.60| 7-10 days $ 713 $ 71.30 3-4 weeks $ 6.59 [ § 65.90| 10 day ARO
A85 BRASS NIPPLE 1" X CLOSE EA 1 $ 254§ 2.54 7-10 days $ 225( % 2.25 3-4 weeks $ 208 $ 2.08| 10 day ARO
A86 BRASS NIPPLE 11/2" X 3" EA 1 $ 737($ 7.37 7-10 days $ 652 $ 6.52] 3-4 weeks $ 6.02 (% 6.02f 10 day ARO
A87 BRASS NIPPLE 1 1/2" X 4" EA 1 $ 9.60 [ $ 9.60 7-10 days $ 849§ 8.49 3-4 weeks $ 785 $ 7.85 10 day ARO
A88 BRASS NIPPLE 11/2" X 6" EA 1 $ 1418 [ $ 14.18 7-10 days $ 1255 | § 12.55 3-4 weeks $ 11.60 | $ 11.60) 10 day ARO
A89 BRASS NIPPLE 2" X 3" EA 10 $ 944§ 94.40 7-10 days $ 835§ 83.50 3-4 weeks $ 772 (% 77.20| 10 day ARO
A90 BRASS NIPPLE 2" X 4" EA 1 $ 1235 § 12.35 7-10 days $ 1093 | $ 10.93 3-4 weeks $ 1010  $ 10.10] 10 day ARO
A91 BRASS NIPPLE 2" X 6" EA 1 $ 1824 [ § 18.24 7-10 days $ 16.13 [ § 16.13] 3-4 weeks $ 14.90 [ $ 14.90| 10 day ARO
A92 BRASS NIPPLE 2" X 12" EA 1 $ 3592 | % 35.92 7-10 days $ 3179 | $ 31.79 3-4 weeks $ 2937 ( § 29.37| 10 day ARO
A93 BRASS NUT 1"PJ CTS (small) EA 200 $ 422|$ 844.00) 7-10 days $ 443 $ 886.00 3-4 weeks $ 428 $ 856.00 15 day ARO
A94 BRASS NUT 1" PJ CTS (large) EA 75 $ 569 ($ 426.75 7-10 days $ 598 | $ 448.50 3-4 weeks $ 579 (% 434.25 15 day ARO
A95 BRASS NUT 1 1/2"CTS PJ (small) EA 10 $ 11.98 [ $ 119.80] 7-10 days $ 12.60 | $ 126.00 3-4 weeks $ 1219 § 121.90 15 day ARO
A96 BRASS NUT 1 1/2" CTS PJ (large) EA 10 $ 17.86 | $ 178.60| 7-10 days $ 1879 | $ 187.90 3-4 weeks $ 18.18 [ 181.80 15 day ARO
A97 BRASS NUT 2"CTSPJ (small) EA 10 $ 16.85 [ $ 168.50] 7-10 days $ 1773 | $ 177.30 3-4 weeks $ 1715 § 171.50 15 day ARO
A98 BRASS NUT 2" CTS PJ (large) EA 10 $ 2265 ($ 226.50) 7-10 days $ 2383 | $ 238.30 3-4 weeks $ 2306 $ 230.60 15 day ARO
A99 BRASS PLUG 1/2" EA 1 $ 334§ 3.34 7-10 days $ 3.60 | $ 3.60 3-4 weeks $ 333($ 3.33] 10 day ARO
A100 BRASS PLUG 3/4" EA 1 $ 420|8% 4.20 7-10 days $ 453 | % 4.53] 3-4 weeks $ 418 | $ 4.18| 10 day ARO
A101 BRASS PLUG 1" EA 1 $ 671 (8% 6.71 7-10 days $ 725( % 7.25 3-4 weeks $ 6.70 [ $ 6.70] 10 day ARO
A102 BRASS PLUG 11/2" EA 1 $ 1176 | $ 11.76| 7-10 days $ 1269 | $ 12.69 3-4 weeks $ 1173 [ § 11.73] 10 day ARO
A103 BRASS PLUG 2" EA 1 $ 19.30 [ $ 19.30 7-10 days $ 2082 | $ 20.82 3-4 weeks $ 19.24 [ § 19.24| 10 day ARO
A104 BRASS SADDLE 04" X 1" (AC/DUCTILE) I.P. EA 1 $ 7381 ($ 73.81 7-10 days $ 7768 | $ 77.68 Stock - 2 wks. $ 76.08 | $ 76.08 10 day ARO
A105 BRASS SADDLE 04" X 1" (C-900) I.P. EA 10 $ 2888 ($ 288.80) 7-10 days $ 30.39 | § 303.90| Stock - 2 wks. $ 2946 | § 294.60 10 day ARO
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Annual Water System Maintenance Parts Supply 2019

Arizona Water Works (Tempe)

Core & Main (Prescott)

Dana Kepner (LHC)

Ferguson Waterworks (Phoenix)

Fortline Waterworks (Peoria)
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A106 BRASS SADDLE 04" X 2" (AC/DUCTILE) I.P. EA 1 93.70 93.70) 7-10 days
A107 BRASS SADDLE 04" X 2" (C-900) I.P. EA 1 72.21 72.21 7-10 days
A108 BRASS SADDLE 04" X1" (SCH 40 PVC) I.P. EA 1 26.43 26.43 7-10 days
A109 BRASS SADDLE 06" X 1" (AC/DUCTILE) I.P. EA 10 86.95 869.50) 7-10 days
A110 BRASS SADDLE 06" X 1" (C-900) I.P. EA 1 39.43 39.43 7-10 days
A1 BRASS SADDLE 06" X 2" (AC/DUCTILE) I.P. EA 5 109.22 546.10) 7-10 days
A112 BRASS SADDLE 06" X 2" (C-900) I.P. EA 1 74.40 74.40 7-10 days
A113 BRASS SADDLE 08" X 1" (AC/DUCTILE) I.P. EA 10 107.60 1,076.00 7-10 days
A114 BRASS SADDLE 08" X 1" (C-900) I.P. EA 1 55.19 55.19 7-10 days
A115 BRASS SADDLE 08" X 2" (AC/DUCTILE) I.P. EA 1 123.32 123.32 7-10 days
A116 BRASS SADDLE 08" X 2" (C-900) I.P. EA 1 84.94 84.94 7-10 days
A117 BRASS SADDLE 10" X 1" (AC/DUCTILE) I.P. EA 1 133.50 133.50] 7-10 days
A118 BRASS SADDLE 10" X 1" (C-900) I.P. EA 1 149.13 149.13 7-10 days
A119 BRASS SADDLE 10" X 2" (AC/DUCTILE) EA 1 157.23 157.23 7-10 days
A120 BRASS SADDLE 10" X 2" (C-900) I.P. EA 1 149.13 149.13 7-10 days
A121 BRASS SADDLE 12" X 1" (AC/DUCTILE) I.P. EA 1 156.00 156.00| 7-10 days
A122 BRASS SADDLE 12" X 1" (C-900) I.P. EA 1 160.66 160.66 7-10 days
A123 BRASS SADDLE 12" X 2" (AC/DUCTILE) I.P. EA 1 179.13 179.13 7-10 days
A124 BRASS SADDLE 12" X 2" (C-900) I.P. EA 1 160.66 160.66| 7-10 days
A125 BRASS SERVICE STOP 2" EA 20 198.59 3,971.80, 7-10 days
A126 BRASS SERVICE STOP FIPT X FIPT 3/4" EA 20 44.02 880.40) 7-10 days
A127 BRASS SERVICE STOP FIPT X FIPT 1" EA 20 67.47 1,349.40 7-10 days
A128 BRASS SERVICE STOP FIPT X FIPT 1 1/2" EA 10 136.34 1,363.40 7-10 days
A129 BRASS SERVICE STOP SWIVEL NUT 3/4" EA 350 50.43 17,650.50! 7-10 days
A130 BRASS SERVICE TEES 3" (small) EA 20 27.43 548.60) 7-10 days
A131 BRASS SERVICE TEES 9" (large) EA 50 55.61 2,780.50] 7-10 days
A132 BRASS TEE 1/2" (WTP) EA 1 5.90 5.90 7-10 days
A133 BRASS TEE 3/4" EA 25 8.38 209.50] 7-10 days
A134 BRASS TEE 1" EA 1 15.12 15.12 7-10 days
A135 BRASS TEE 11/2" EA 1 29.39 29.39 7-10 days
A136 BRASS TEE 17%"x1%"x1" EA 5 46.75 233.75 7-10 days
A137 BRASS TEE 2" EA 1 48.71 48.71 7-10 days
A138 BRASS TEE 2"x2"x1" EA 1 76.07 76.07| 7-10 days
A139 BRASS COUPLING 1" MIPT X PEP PJ C86-44 EA 1 23.72 23.72 7-10 days
A140 BRASS COUPLING REPAIR 1" PEP PJ C66-44 EA 1 37.44 37.44 7-10 days
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98.62 98.62 Stock - 2 wks. 96.59 | $ 96.59| 10 day ARO
76.00 76.00[ Stock - 2 wks. 7443 ( $ 74.43| 10 day ARO
27.81 27.81 Stock - 2 wks. 2724 | $ 27.24] 10 day ARO
91.52 915.20( Stock - 2 wks. 88.72( $ 887.20 10 day ARO
41.49 41.49| Stock - 2 wks. 4064 [ $ 40.64| 10 day ARO

114.96 574.80| Stock - 2 wks. 11259 [ § 562.95| 10 day ARO
78.31 78.31 Stock - 2 wks. 76.69 | $ 76.69| 10 day ARO
113.25 1,132.50 Stock - 2 wks. 11092 [ 1,109.20 10 day ARO
58.08 58.08 Stock - 2 wks. 56.89 | $ 56.89 10 day ARO
129.86 129.86| Stock - 2 wks. 12712 $ 127.12 10 day ARO
89.40 89.40 Stock - 2 wks. 87.56 | $ 87.56 10 day ARO
140.31 140.31| Stock - 2 wks. 13741 ( § 137.41 10 day ARO
156.97 156.97| Stock - 2 wks. 163.73 | § 153.73 10 day ARO
165.49 165.49| Stock - 2 wks. 162.08 [ § 162.08 10 day ARO
156.97 156.97| Stock - 2 wks. 163.73 | § 153.73 10 day ARO
164.20 164.20| Stock - 2 wks. 160.81 [ § 160.81 10 day ARO
169.11 169.11| Stock - 2 wks. 165.62 | § 165.62 10 day ARO
188.55 188.55| Stock - 2 wks. 184.66 | $ 184.66 10 day ARO
169.11 169.11| Stock - 2 wks. 165.62 | § 165.62 10 day ARO
209.04 4,180.80 Stock - 2 wks. 202.22 | $ 4,044.40 10 day ARO
46.34 926.80( Stock - 2 wks. 4483 § 896.60 10 day ARO
71.01 1,420.20 Stock - 2 wks. 68.70 [ § 1,374.00 10 day ARO
143.51 1,435.10 Stock - 2 wks. 138.83 | § 1,388.30] 10 day ARO
53.07 18,574.50| Stock - 2 wks. 51.00 | § 17,850.00] 10 day ARO
28.86 577.20, 3-4 weeks 2793 [ § 558.60| 10 day ARO
58.53 2,926.50| 3-4 weeks 56.62 | $ 2,831.00 10 day ARO
6.36 6.36 3-4 weeks 588 (% 5.88| 10 day ARO
9.04 226.00 3-4 weeks 836 (% 209.00 10 day ARO
16.32 16.32] 3-4 weeks 15.08 [ $ 15.08| 10 day ARO
31.72 31.72 3-4 weeks 2930 $ 29.30| 10 day ARO
50.45 252.25 3-4 weeks 4661 § 233.05 10 day ARO
52.56 52.56 3-4 weeks 4858  $ 48.58 10 day ARO
82.08 82.08 3-4 weeks 7584 $ 75.84| 10 day ARO
24.96 24.96 Stock - 2 wks. 2419 ( § 24.19| 10 day ARO
39.40 39.40 Stock - 2 wks. 3819 | § 38.19| 10 day ARO

Quote Price d Price
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Annual Water System Maintenance Parts Supply 2019

Arizona Water Works (Tempe)

Core & Main (Prescott)

Dana Kepner (LHC)

Ferguson Waterworks (Phoenix)

Fortline Waterworks (Peoria)

Line # Part Class Description Unit of Measure N;f:elro Quote Price Extended Price Availability
A141 BRASS NUT 1" PEP PG (SMALL) NG-F6-NG-H4 EA 1 792 (8% 7.92 7-10 days
A142 BRASS NUT 1" PEP PG (LARGE) NG-FF6-NG-HH4 EA 1 10.16 | $ 10.16| 7-10 days
A143 BRASS ANGLE BALL VALVE 1" FIP X SWIVEL NUT BA13-444W EA 1
B1 CAST IRON ?i(CEi%SggLYT};I;SNﬂT(SC;LAND PACKS - COMPACT) (MJ GLAND, MJ GASKET & EA 1 1549 | § 15.49 710 days
| omron  frecesonmes cuse ooy o | ™
o | ostron  pecEssenios use e comraen o 1
s | omron frecesone i cuvoriors - coweacn o |
o5 crsTIRON  [ACCESSORY KITs 22 (GLAND PACKS - COUPACT) En | %553 s S
B6 CAST IRON ADAPTER FLANGE (FIELD FLANGE) 4" EA 1 4163 | $ 41.63 7-10 days
B7 CAST IRON ADAPTER FLANGE (FIELD FLANGE) 6" EA 1 56.10 [ $ 56.10 7-10 days
B8 CAST IRON ADAPTER FLANGE (FIELD FLANGE) 8" EA 1 88.62 ( $ 88.62 7-10 days
B9 CAST IRON DUCTILE IRON PIPE 4" PC 350/ Class 51 Push On FT 20
B10 CAST IRON DUCTILE IRON PIPE 6" PC 350/ Class 50 Push On FT 80
B11 CAST IRON DUCTILE IRON PIPE 8" PC 350 Push On FT 20
B12 CAST IRON EXTENDED RANGE CAST COUPLING  (4") EA 6 89.17 | § 535.02 7-10 days
B13 CAST IRON EXTENDED RANGE CAST COUPLING  (6") EA 30 126.12 [ $ 3,783.60 7-10 days
B14 CAST IRON EXTENDED RANGE CAST COUPLING  (8") EA 20 14725 [ $ 2,945.00 7-10 days
B15 CAST IRON EXTENDED RANGE CAST COUPLING  (10") EA 1 188.41  $ 188.41 7-10 days
B16 CAST IRON EXTENDED RANGE CAST COUPLING  (12") EA 1 22233 | $ 222.33 7-10 days
B17 CAST IRON g:;lir:{t/:\gzgev/ AZA‘:JOXp’\eArJa(ing Nut-Epoxy Coating EA 1 299.92 | § 299.92 7-10 days
B18 CAST IRON GATE VALVE 04" FL X FL EA 1 335.13 | § 335.13 7-10 days
B19 CAST IRON gg;lir:{t/:\gzgtv/ AZA‘:JOXpS;a(ing Nut-Epoxy Coating EA 6 323.01| $ 1,938.06 7-10 days
B20 CAST IRON g:;lin\{/\\NLe\{:lEg:?N/ ’;I,:J(;(p’:l;ﬁng Nut-Epoxy Coating EA 15 338.02 | $ 5,070.30; 7-10 days
B21 CAST IRON g:;lirxt/:\ijzgal ZL épFeLra(ing Nut-Epoxy Coating EA 1 || gl 70ldays
g2z CASIIRON g:;lin\{/\\NLe\{:lEg:a/ ’;I':J(;(pzlr.ating Nut-Epoxy Coating = i AElED | & iy =S
B23 CAST IRON g:;lir:{t/:\gzgal AZA‘:JOXp’\eArJa(ing Nut-Epoxy Coating EA 30 43155 $ 12,946.50| 7-10 days
E2 CASIIRON g:;lin\{/\\NLe\{:lEg:a/ ZL Z)(pzl_rating Nut-Epoxy Coating = 0 wIRED || 65 e S
B25 CAST IRON g:;lir:{t/:\gzgsv/ AZA‘:JOXpS;a(ing Nut-Epoxy Coating EA 2 674.02 | $ 1,348.04 7-10 days
E28 CASIIRON g:;lin\{/\\NLe\{:lEg:a/ ’;I':J(;(p’:lr\i:ting Nut-Epoxy Coating = 0 G2 || 6 5854 S
B27 CAST IRON GATE VALVE 10" FL X FL EA 1 1,11163 | § 1,111.63 7-10 days
B28 CAST IRON GATE VALVE 10" MJ X FL EA 1 1,070.64 [ $ 1,070.64 7-10 days
B29 CAST IRON gg;lir:{t/:\gzgal AZA‘:JOXp’\eArJa(ing Nut-Epoxy Coating EA 1 1,070.64 [ $ 1,070.64 7-10 days
B30 CAST IRON GATE VALVE 12" FL X FL EA 1 1,342.56 | $ 1,342.56 7-10 days
B31 CAST IRON GATE VALVE 12" MJ X FL EA 1 1,29291| § 1,292.91 7-10 days
B32 CAST IRON g:;lin\{/\\NLe\{:lEggzw/ ’;I,:J(;(p’:l;ﬁng Nut-Epoxy Coating EA 1 1,354.68 [ $ 1,354.68 7-10 days

A:\Departmental Resources\Procurement & Contracts\ITB\B20-WTR-3247 Annual Water System Parts Supply\05.Bids & Related Documents\ANNUAL PARTS FY19-20 wLS Requirements Basis

Quote Price Extended Price

Availability

Quote Price Extended Price Availability Quote Price Extended Price Availability Quote Price d Price A
833§ 8.33 3-4 weeks 8.07 | $ 8.07| 10 day ARO
1068 | $ 10.68 3-4 weeks 10.36 | $ 10.36| 10 day ARO
2375 $ 23.75 2-3 weeks 19.64  $ 19.64] 15 day ARO
2832 $ 28.32 2-3 weeks 2342 | $ 23.42 15 day ARO
3251 § 32.51 2-3 weeks 2720 ( $ 27.20| 15 day ARO
4293 | § 42.93] 2-3 weeks 3778 | $ 37.78 8 day ARO
4567 | $ 45.67| 2-3 weeks 4004 40.04| 8 day ARO
4381 $ 43.81 2-3 weeks 4247 | $ 42.47| 15 day ARO
59.04 | § 59.04 2-3 weeks 5723 § 57.23 15 day ARO
9327 | $ 93.27 2-3 weeks 9042 | $ 90.42| 15 day ARO
19.69 | $ 393.80| Stock 16.75 [ § 335.00 5 day ARO
14.90 [ $ 1,192.00 Stock 1470 [ § 1,176.00] 5 day ARO
1961 $ 392.20| Stock 1572 ( § 314.40 5 day ARO
9385 [ $ 563.10, 2-3 weeks 93.86 | § 563.16| 15 day ARO
13275 § 3,982.50 2-3 weeks 13001  § 3,900.30 15 day ARO
154.99 [ $ 3,099.80| 2-3 weeks 151.80 | § 3,036.00] 15 day ARO
198.32 [ § 198.32 2-3 weeks 198.32 [ § 198.32 15 day ARO
23402 | $ 234.02 2-3 weeks 23402 | $ 234.02 15 day ARO
34497 | $ 344.97| Stock 32381 % 323.81 3 weeks 349.23 [ $ 349.23
381.83 | § 381.83] Stock 358.86 | $ 358.86| 3 weeks 386.67 | $ 386.67
368.23 | $ 2,209.38 Stock 341.94 | § 2,051.64] 3 weeks 37234 | $ 2,234.04
38534 | § 5,780.10| Stock 358.17 | $ 5,372.55] 3 weeks 390.24 | § 5,853.60
51043 | $ 510.43] Stock 47938 | $ 479.38 3 weeks 516.89 | $ 516.89
492.00 | $ 4,920.00 Stock 457.05 [ § 4,570.50] 3 weeks 49776 | $ 4,977.60
492.00 | $ 14,760.00| Stock 450.00 | $ 13,500.00] 3 weeks 49776 | $ 14,932.80
797.90 | § 797.90, Stock 74938 | $ 749.38] 3 weeks 807.74 | $ 807.74
768.50 | $ 1,537.00 Stock 720.00 | $ 1,440.00] 3 weeks 77781 | $ 1,555.62
78298 | § 782.98| Stock 73547 | $ 735.47| 3 weeks 79276 | $ 792.76
1,267.51 [ $ 1,267.51 Stock 1,190.72 | $ 1,190.72] 3 weeks 128359 | § 1,283.59
1,220.56 | $ 1,220.56 Stock 1,146.80 [ § 1,146.80] 3 weeks 1,236.07 | $ 1,236.07
1,220.56 | $ 1,220.56 Stock 145113 | $ 1,451.13] 3 weeks 1,236.07 | § 1,236.07
1,530.84 [ $ 1,530.84 Stock 1,437.84 [ § 1,437.84] 3 weeks 1,549.74 | $ 1,549.74
147423 [ $ 1,474.23 Stock 1,38464 | $ 1,384.64] 3 weeks 149233 | § 1,492.33
1,5644.46 | $ 1,544 .46 Stock 1,451.13 | § 1,451.13] 3 weeks 1,564.08 | $ 1,564.08
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Annual Water System Maintenance Parts Supply 2019

Arizona Water Works (Tempe)

Core & Main (Prescott)

Dana Kepner (LHC)

Ferguson Waterworks (Phoenix)
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Line # Part Class Description Unit of Measure N;f:elro Quote Price Extended Price Availability Quote Price Extended Price Availability Quote Price Extended Price Availability Quote Price Extended Price Availability Quote Price d Price A

B33 CAST IRON MEGA LUG KIT 04" (C-900) w/ accessories EA 40 2847 $ 1,138.80 7-10 days 29.96 | $ 1,198.40 2-3 weeks 2899  § 1,159.60] 3 weeks

B34 CAST IRON MEGA LUG KIT 04" (DIP) w/ accessories EA 20 2484 ($ 496.80| 7-10 days 26.14 | $ 522.80| 2-3 weeks 2529 § 505.80| 3 weeks

B35 CAST IRON MEGA LUG KIT 06" (C-900) w/ accessories EA 40 3840 $ 1,536.00 7-10 days 4041 [ $ 1,616.40 2-3 weeks 39.10 | $ 1,564.00] 3 weeks

B36 CAST IRON MEGA LUG KIT 06" (DIP) w/ accessories EA 20 30.90 [ $ 618.00) 7-10 days 3252 | § 650.40 2-3 weeks 3146 | $ 629.20 3 weeks

B37 CAST IRON MEGA LUG KIT 08" (C-900) w/ accessories EA 40 4861 $ 1,944.40 7-10 days 51.16 | $ 2,046.40| 2-3 weeks 4950 [ § 1,980.00] 3 weeks

B38 CAST IRON MEGA LUG KIT 08" (DIP) w/ accessories EA 20 4193 $ 838.60) 7-10 days 4413 [ $ 882.60 2-3 weeks 4269 $ 853.80 3 weeks

B39 CAST IRON MEGA LUG KIT 10" (C-900) w/ accessories EA 1 8379 | $ 83.79 7-10 days 8819 | § 88.19 2-3 weeks 8549 [ § 85.49 3 weeks

B40 CAST IRON MEGA LUG KIT 10" (DIP) w/ accessories EA 1 5991 ( § 59.91 7-10 days 63.05( $ 63.05 2-3 weeks 61.12( § 61.12] 3 weeks

B41 CAST IRON MEGA LUG KIT 12" (C-900) w/ accessories EA 1 88.17 | § 88.17| 7-10 days 9280 [ $ 92.80 2-3 weeks 89.96 | $ 89.96| 3 weeks

B42 CAST IRON MEGA LUG KIT 12" (DIP) w/ accessories EA 1 80.31($ 80.31 7-10 days 8453 [ § 84.53 2-3 weeks 81.94 ( § 81.94| 3 weeks

B43 CAST IRON MEGA LUG RING 04" (C-900) EA 1 2047 | $ 20.47| 7-10 days 2154 | § 21.54 2-3 weeks 2088 | $ 20.88 3 weeks

B44 CAST IRON MEGA LUG RING 04" (DUCTILE IRON) EA 1 15.63 | $ 15.63 7-10 days 1644 | $ 16.44 2-3 weeks 15.94  § 15.94] 3 weeks

B45 CAST IRON MEGA LUG RING 06" (C-900) EA 1 2480 | $ 24.80 7-10 days 26.09 | $ 26.09 2-3 weeks 23.02( $ 23.02f 3 weeks

B46 CAST IRON MEGA LUG RING 06" (DUCTILE IRON) EA 1 18.39 ( § 18.39 7-10 days 1935 | § 19.35 2-3 weeks 18.76 | $ 18.76| 3 weeks

B47 CAST IRON MEGA LUG RING 08" (C-900) EA 1 3593 | $ 35.93 7-10 days 3781 8 37.81 2-3 weeks 36.65| $ 36.65| 3 weeks

B48 CAST IRON MEGA LUG RING 08" (DUCTILE IRON) EA 1 2807 ( $ 28.07| 7-10 days 2954  § 29.54 2-3 weeks 2863 $ 28.63| 3 weeks

B49 CAST IRON MEGA LUG RING 10" (C-900) EA 1 65.04 | $ 65.04 7-10 days 6845 | § 68.45 2-3 weeks 66.36 | $ 66.36| 3 weeks

B50 CAST IRON MEGA LUG RING 10" (DUCTILE IRON) EA 1 4154 [ $ 41.54 7-10 days 4372 | $ 43.72] 2-3 weeks 4238 $ 42.38 3 weeks

B51 CAST IRON MEGA LUG RING 12" (C-900) EA 1 68.36 | $ 68.36] 7-10 days 7195 | § 71.95 2-3 weeks 69.74 [ § 69.74 3 weeks

B52 CAST IRON MEGA LUG RING 12" (DUCTILE IRON) EA 1 6043 [ $ 60.43] 7-10 days 63.60 [ $ 63.60 2-3 weeks 61.65 | $ 61.65| 3 weeks

B53 CAST IRON TEE 4" MJXMJXFL EA 1 137.01  $ 137.01 7-10 days 138.71 | $ 138.71 Stock 12350 | § 123.50 3 weeks

B54 CAST IRON TEE 6" MJXMJXFL EA 5 19228 [ $ 961.40) 7-10 days 19431 [ § 971.55 Stock 17334 ( § 866.70 3 weeks

B55 CAST IRON TEE 8"MJXMJX6"FL EA 1 34407 | § 344.07| 7-10 days 375.90 | § 375.90, Stock 21956 | $ 219.56 3 weeks

B56 CAST IRON VALVE BOX BOTTOM 30" (SCREW TYPE) EA 40 5459 | § 2,183.60] 7-10 days 5936 | $ 2,374.40| 2-3 weeks 5162 ( 2,064.80 3 weeks

B57 CAST IRON VALVE BOX BOTTOM 24" (SCREW TYPE) EA 40 4983 | § 1,993.20 7-10 days 5419 | § 2,167.60| 2-3 weeks 4817 [ § 1,926.80] 3 weeks ARO

B58 CAST IRON VALVE BOX TOP 16" (SCREW TYPE) - MEDIUM EA 80 4153 [ $ 3,322.40] 7-10 days 12221 § 9,776.80 2-3 weeks 3055 | $ 2,444.00 3 weeks ARO

B59 CAST IRON VALVE BOXLIDS 2" EA 100 2228 $ 2,228.00] 7-10 days 2423 [ $ 2,423.00| 2-3 weeks 3456 | $ 3,456.00 3 weeks ARO

B60 CAST IRON VALVE BOX RISER 2" EA 5 28.16 [ $ 140.80) 7-10 days 3063 | $ 153.15 2-3 weeks 2693 ( $ 134.65 3 weeks ARO

B61 CAST IRON VALVE BOX RISER 3" EA 25 35.75 | § 893.75 7-10 days 38.88 | $ 972.00 2-3 weeks 36.80 | $ 920.00 3 weeks ARO

B62 CAST IRON VALVE BOX RISER 4" EA 25 4333 $ 1,083.25 7-10 days 4713 [ $ 1,178.25 2-3 weeks 4143 $ 1,035.75 3 weeks ARO

B63 CAST IRON VALVE BOX RISER 6" EA 40 5741 | $ 2,296.40; 7-10 days 6244 | $ 2,497.60| 2-3 weeks 5489  § 2,195.60] 3 weeks ARO

c1 FH HYDRANT FLANGE 5 1/4" X 4' Bury EA 1 149453 | § 1,494.53 14-21 days 1,756.00 | $ 1,756.00| 3 days APO 1,590.85 | $ 1,590.85 3-4 weeks 143367 | $ 1,433.67| 5 weeks ARO 1,561.46 | $ 1,561.46
Cc2 FH HYDRANT FLANGE 5 1/4" X 4 1/2' Bury EA 2 1,529.23 [ § 3,058.46) 14-21 days 1,797.00 | $ 3,594.00 3 days APO 1,628.05 [ $ 3,256.10 3-4 weeks 1,467.35 [ § 2,934.70] 5 weeks ARO 1,597.66 | $ 3,195.32
C3 FH HYDRANT FLANGE 5 1/4" X 5' Bury EA 1 1,563.93 | § 1,563.93 14-21 days 1,837.00 | $ 1,837.00| 3 days APO 1,664.75 | $ 1,664.75 3-4 weeks 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00] 5 weeks ARO 163393 | § 1,633.93
C4 FH HYDRANT FLANGE 5 1/4"X51/2' Bury EA 1 1,598.63 [ § 1,598.63 14-21 days 1,879.00 | $ 1,879.00| 3 days APO 1,701.93 [ $ 1,701.93 3-4 weeks 1,5633.67 [ § 1,5633.67| 5 weeks ARO 1,670.16 | $ 1,670.16

A:\Departmental Resources\Procurement & Contracts\ITB\B20-WTR-3247 Annual Water System Parts Supply\05.Bids & Related Documents\ANNUAL PARTS FY19-20 wLS Requirements Basis

10/13/2019 @ 6:45 AM




Annual Water System Maintenance Parts Supply 2019

Arizona Water Works (Tempe)

Core & Main (Prescott)

Dana Kepner (LHC)

Ferguson Waterworks (Phoenix)

Fortline Waterworks (Peoria)

Line # Part Class Description Unit of Measure N;f:elro Quote Price Extended Price Availability Quote Price Extended Price Availability Quote Price Extended Price Availability Quote Price Extended Price Availability Quote Price d Price A
c5 FH HYDRANT FLANGE 51/4"X6'  Bury EA 1 1,633.33 | § 1,633.33|  14-21 days 1,920.00 | § 1,920.00| 3 days APO $ 1,738.64 | $ 1,738.64|  3-4 weeks 1,567.35 | $ 1,567.35| 5 weeks ARO 1,706.34 | § 1,706.34
c6 FH HYDRANT MJ 51/4"X4  Bury EA 2 149453 | § 2,989.06|  14-21 days 1,756.00 | § 3512.00]  3days APO $ 1,590.85 | $ 3,181.70 Stock 143368 | $ 2,867.36| 5 weeks ARO 1,561.46 | $ 3,122.92
c7 FH HYDRANT MJ 51/4" X 4 1/2' Bury EA 7 1529.23 | § 10704.61|  14-21 days 1,797.00 | § 12,579.00| 3 days APO $ 1,628.05 | $ 11,396.35 Stock 1,467.35 | $ 10,271.45| 5 weeks ARO 1,597.66 | $ 11,183.62
cs FH HYDRANT MJ 51/4"X5  Bury EA 5 1,563.93 | § 7,819.65|  14-21 days 1,837.00 | § 9,185.00 3 days APO $ 1,664.75 | $ 8,323.75 Stock 1,500.00 | $ 7,500.00] 5 weeks ARO 163392 | § 8,169.60
c9 FH HYDRANT MJ 51/4" X 5 1/2' Bury EA 6 1,598.63 | $ 9,591.78|  14-21 days 1,879.00 | § 1127400 3 days APO $ 1,701.93 | $ 10,211.58 Stock 1,533.68 | $ 9,202.08] 5 weeks ARO 1,670.16 | $ 10,020.96
c10 FH HYDRANT MJ 51/4"X6  Bury EA 5 163333 | § 8,166.65|  14-21 days 1,920.00 | § 9,600.00] 3 days APO $ 173864 | $ 8,693.20 Stock 1,567.35 | $ 7,836.75| 5 weeks ARO 1,706.34 | § 8,531.70
ci1 FH 4" GALVANIZED PIPE - 20 FT. LENGTHS (used for 4" FH) FT 20 15.00 [ $ 30000 3 days APO $ 17.09 | $ 341.80|  1-2 weeks 2787 |'$ 557.40| 5 weeks ARO
c12 FH 4" GALVANIZED 90s (thread x thread) PCS 5 14115 | § 70575  14-21 days 53.00 | $ 26500 3 days APO $ 5546 | $ 277.30 Stock 9798 | $ 489.90| 5 weeks ARO
c13 FH 4" GALVANIZED 90s ST. ELL PCS 1 20755 | § 207.58  14-21 days 65.83 | $ 6583 3 days APO $ 6125 61.25 Stock 13721 8 137.21] 5 weeks ARO
c14 FH 4" GALVANIZED COUPLINGS PCS 1 13594 | § 13594  14-21 days 51.00 | $ 51000 3 days APO $ 67.71| $ 67.71 Stock 9437 $ 9437 5 weeks ARO
c15 FH 4" GALVANIZED CLOSE NIPPLE PCS 2 4002 | $ 80.04  14-21 days 13.00 [ $ 26.000 3 days APO $ 10.00 | $ 20.00 Stock 2140 | § 4280 5 weeks ARO
D1 MISC BOLT PAK 4" FLANGE 5/8"X 3" PLATED BOLTS & NUTS - Packages of 8 PKG 30 580§ 174000  10-14 days $ 12.00 | $ 360.00]  2-3 weeks 5318 159.30] 2 weeks ARO
D2 MISC SBOLT R @ FANEE @R FUWED ERLSENNS-FEEeg:s ¢ PKG 40 800|$ 32000  10-14 days $ 1788 | 715.20]  2-3 weeks 831|$ 33240| 2 weeks ARO
D3 MISC PAINT MARKING BLUE (200z) 12 ct in case cs 25 4620 | $ 1,155.00  10-14 days 320 s 80.00] 2 weeks ARO
D4 MISC PAINT MARKING WHITE (200z) 12 ct in case cs 20 46.20 | $ 92400 10-14 days 320§ 64.00] 2 weeks ARO
D5 MISC PAINT MARKING PURPLE (200z) 12 ct in case cs 2 4620 | $ 9240  10-14 days 320 s 6.40| 2 weeks ARO
D6 MISC PAINT MARKING GREEN (200z) 12 ct in case cs 25 4620 | $ 1,155.00|  10-14 days 320§ 80.00] 2 weeks ARO
D7 MISC PAINT MARKING ORANGE (200z) 12 ctin case cs 1 4620 | $ 4620  10-14 days 320 s 3200 2 weeks ARO
D8 MISC PAINT MARKING BLACK (2002) 12 ctin case cs 2 4620 | $ 9240  10-14 days 320§ 6.40| 2 weeks ARO
E1 PLASTIC &%'SZS;; ITEL:SE (;/‘ :;tycg’PER) 3" DIAMETER BMIL ROLL 10 5212 [ 52120 10-14 days $ 63.94 | $ 639.40 Stock 4935 $ 49350|  5day ARO
E2 PLASTIC POLYWRAP 20"  (please specify length and type) ROLL 5 16022 | $ 801.10  10-14 days $ 14360 | $ 718.00 Stock 79.78 | $ 39890  5dayARO
E3 PLASTIC REPAIR COUPLING - PVC 4" HARCO (for SCH-40 pvc) HARCO EA 20 2873 | $ 57460  10-14 days $ 3448 s 689.60  2-3 weeks 3285 $ 657.000 10 day ARO
E4 PLASTIC g‘g}sz 'l‘l"dgfg iﬂ’;v‘(’;g (g:x'é'stg:';\acl:;?w EA 400 2870 | $ 11,480.00]  10-14 days $ 2870 | $ 11,480.00 Stock 2592 | $ 10,368.00| 10 day ARO
E5 PLASTIC WATER METER BOX "LID ONLY" FOR BLACK 3/4" BOX EA 1 898 | 898  10-14 days $ 951 s 9.51 Stock 627 627  10day ARO
E6 PLASTIC WATER METER BOX w/ top lid BLACK 1" Medium - 12" X 20" EA 1 50.07 | $ 50.07  10-14 days $ 5301 $ 5301  2-3weeks 50.18 | $ 50.18] 10 day ARO
E7 PLASTIC WATER METER BOX - FIBERLITE TRAFFIC (no lid, grey) SMALL 10" X 15" EA 30 51.04 | $ 1,531.20|  10-14 days $ 5104 | $ 153120 2-3 weeks 5350 | § 1,605.00( 10 day ARO
E8 PLASTIC WATER METER BOX LIDS - FIBERLITE TRAFFIC (grey) SMALL EA 50 3319 $ 1,659.50|  10-14 days $ 3319 | $ 1,659.50|  2-3 weeks 2442 s 1,221.00( 10 day ARO
E9 PLASTIC %ﬁ[ﬁ;ygi';iox 12" FIBERLITE standard (no lid) EA 1 86.07 | § 86.07  10-14 days $ 9113 | § 91.13| 23 weeks 8183 | $ 81.83 10 day ARO
E10 PLASTIC WATER METER BOX LIDS - WATER lid for 12" EA 5 81.71 | $ 40858  10-14 days $ 81.71| § 408.55|  2-3 weeks 57.02 | § 28510 10 day ARO
E11 PLASTIC ?gfﬁ;ygi';iox 18" FIBERLITE large (no lid) EA 1 212418 21241 10-14 days $ 204918 22491 2-3 weeks 20246 | § 202.46) 10 day ARO
E12 PLASTIC WATER METER BOX LIDS - WATER lid for 18" EA 5 12932 | § 646.60  10-14 days $ 12932 | $ 646.60  2-3 weeks 12313 | § 615.65| 10 day ARO
E13 PLASTIC NDS PRO SERIES METER BOX  17"X30"X18" EA 6 118.08 | § 70848  10-14 days $ 118.08 | § 708.48|  2-3 weeks 16135 | § 968.10 10 day ARO
E14 PLASTIC NDS PRO SERIES LID PLASTIC w/C1 READER COVER EA 10 87.90 | $ 879.00  10-14 days $ 87.90 | $ 879.00  2-3 weeks 9228 § 92280 10 day ARO
F1 RUBBER GASKETS 1/16" X 3/4" THIN MTR (washer) EA 2,000 041|s 82000  10-14 days $ 046 | $ 920.00 Stock 010 s 20000  5day ARO
F2 RUBBER GASKETS 1/8" x 3/4" THICK MTR (washer) EA 4,000 022 880.00  10-14 days $ 0248 960.00 Stock 015 s 600.00] 5 day ARO
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F3 RUBBER GASKETS 1" THICK MTR EA 500 0.23 115.00) 10-14 days
F4 RUBBER GASKETS 1"PJ ANTI-FRICTION RING (SMALL) EA 1 0.12 0.12 10-14 days
F5 RUBBER GASKETS 1"PJ GASKET ONLY (SMALL) EA 1 0.44 0.44 10-14 days
F6 RUBBER GASKETS 1"PJ ANTI-FRICTION RING (LARGE) EA 1 0.12 0.12 10-14 days
F7 RUBBER GASKETS 1"PJ GASKET ONLY (LARGE) EA 1 0.44 0.44 10-14 days
F8 RUBBER GASKETS 4" FLANGE FULL FACE, SOILD RUBBER EA 1 1.84 1.84 10-14 days
F9 RUBBER GASKETS 4" DROP-IN EA 1 0.70 0.70 10-14 days
F10 RUBBER GASKETS 6" FLANGE FULL FACE, SOILD RUBBER EA 1 1.99 1.99 10-14 days
F11 RUBBER GASKETS 6" DROP-IN EA 1 1.35 1.39 10-14 days
F12 RUBBER GASKETS 8" FLANGE FULL FACE, SOILD RUBBER EA 1 3.25 3.25 10-14 days
F13 RUBBER GASKETS 8" DROP-IN EA 1 217 2.17] 10-14 days
F14 RUBBER GASKETS 1 1/2" X 3/16" ELIPTICAL (DROP IN) EA 1 1.90 1.90 10-14 days
F15 RUBBER GASKETS 2" X 3/16" ELIPTICAL EA 1 2.16 2.1 10-14 days
G1 STAINLESS STEEL [NIPPLE 1 %" X CLOSE 304 GRADE EA 75 14.58 1,093.50 7-10 days
G2 STAINLESS STEEL [NIPPLE 2" X CLOSE 304 GRADE EA 25 20.05 501.25 7-10 days
G3 STAINLESS STEEL [REPAIR CLAMP 04" X 12.5" 4.75-5.57 AC EA 1 121.66 121.66| 7-10 days
G4 STAINLESS STEEL [REPAIR CLAMP 04" X 12.5" 4.45-4.73 for SCH-40 pvc EA 1 64.59 64.59 7-10 days
G5 STAINLESS STEEL (REPAIR CLAMP 04" X 7.5" 4.45-4.73 for SCH-40 pvc EA 1 40.35 40.35 7-10 days
G6 STAINLESS STEEL |REPAIR CLAMP 04" X 7.5" 4.74-5.57 AC EA 1 84.08 84.08 7-10 days
G7 STAINLESS STEEL |[REPAIR CLAMP 06" X 15"  6.84 - 7.64 EA 1 155.70 155.70| 7-10 days
G8 STAINLESS STEEL [REPAIR CLAMP 06" X 7.5" 6.84-7.64 EA 1 91.33 91.33 7-10 days
G9 STAINLESS STEEL (REPAIR CLAMP 08" X 10" 8.99 - 9.79 EA 1 124.82 124.82 7-10 days
G10 STAINLESS STEEL [REPAIR CLAMP 08" X 15"  8.99 - 9.79 EA 1 164.74 164.74 7-10 days
G11 STAINLESS STEEL (REPAIR CLAMP 08" X 20" 8.99-9.79 EA 1 267.15 267.15 7-10 days
G12 STAINLESS STEEL [REPAIR CLAMP 10" X 7.5" 11.75-12.15 EA 1 78.43 78.43 7-10 days
G13 STAINLESS STEEL |[REPAIR CLAMP 10" X 10"  11.60 - 12.40 EA 1 144.41 144.41 7-10 days
G14 STAINLESS STEEL [REPAIR CLAMP 10" X 15"  11.60 - 12.40 EA 1 191.29 191.29 7-10 days
G15 STAINLESS STEEL |[REPAIR CLAMP 12" x 10" 12.70 - 13.50 EA 1 152.16 152.16| 7-10 days
G16 STAINLESS STEEL [REPAIR CLAMP 12" X 15" 13.65- 14.45 EA 1 216.24 216.24 7-10 days
G17 STAINLESS STEEL |[REPAIR CLAMP 12" x 15"  14.00 - 14.40 EA 1 161.21 161.21 7-10 days
G18 STAINLESS STEEL [REPAIR CLAMP 12" X 20" 13.65- 14.45 EA 1 295.57 295.57| 7-10 days
G19 STAINLESS STEEL |REPAIR CLAMP 12" x 20" 14.00 - 14.40 EA 1 224.65 224.65 7-10 days
G20 STAINLESS STEEL [REPAIR CLAMP 16" X 20" 17.10-18.30 EA 1 463.92 463.92 7-10 days
G21 STAINLESS STEEL |REPAIR CLAMP 16" x 20" 17.15-17.90 EA 1 371.86 371.86] 7-10 days
G22 STAINLESS STEEL |REPAIR CLAMP 18"x 20" 18.10 - 19.30 EA 1 471.68 471.68 7-10 days
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Quote Price Extended Price

Availability

Quote Price Extended Price Availability Quote Price Extended Price Availability
026 | $ 130.00 Stock 0.16 | § 80.00 5 day ARO
015 | § 0.15} 2-3 weeks 016  $ 0.16| 5 day ARO
055§ 0.55 2-3 weeks 057 [ $ 0.57| 5 day ARO
015 | § 0.15} 2-3 weeks 016  $ 0.16| 5 day ARO
055§ 0.55 2-3 weeks 057 | $ 0.57| 5 day ARO
156 | $ 1.56 Stock 682 % 6.82f 5 day ARO
221 $ 221 Stock 1.06 | $ 1.06| 5 day ARO
1711 8 1.71 Stock 287 (% 2.87| 5 day ARO
299§ 2.99 Stock 294 $ 2.94 5 day ARO
268 | $ 2.68| Stock 453 | % 4.53] 5 day ARO
465 $ 4.65| Stock 416 | $ 4.16| 5 day ARO
211 $ 2.1 Stock 6.96 [ $ 6.96 5 day ARO
240 $ 2.40 Stock 1.96 | $ 1.96| 5 day ARO
219 $ 164.25 1-2 weeks 219§ 164.25 5 day ARO
340 | $ 85.00 1-2 weeks 340 (% 85.00 5 day ARO

128.05 | $ 128.05| Stock - 3 wks. 12413 § 124.13 10 day ARO
67.98 | § 67.98 Stock - 3 wks. 65.90 [ $ 65.90| 10 day ARO
4246 | $ 42.46| Stock - 3 wks. 41.16 | $ 41.16| 10 day ARO
8849 | § 88.49 Stock - 3 wks. 8579 | $ 85.79 10 day ARO

163.88 [ $ 163.88| Stock - 3 wks. 158.87 [ § 158.87 10 day ARO
96.13 | § 96.13 Stock - 3 wks. 93.18 | § 93.18 10 day ARO

13138 | § 131.38| Stock - 3 wks. 12736 | $ 127.36 10 day ARO

17340 | $ 173.40| Stock - 3 wks. 168.09 | $ 168.09 10 day ARO

281.20 | $ 281.20( Stock - 3 wks. 27259 | $ 272.59 10 day ARO
8256 | $ 82.56 Stock - 3 wks. 80.03 [ $ 80.03 10 day ARO

152.00 | $ 152.00| Stock - 3 wks. 14735 § 147.35 10 day ARO

201.35 | $ 201.35( Stock - 3 wks. 195.18 [ § 195.18 10 day ARO

160.16 | $ 160.16| Stock - 3 wks. 155.26 [ § 155.26 10 day ARO

22761 | $ 22761 Stock - 3 wks. 22064 | $ 220.64 10 day ARO

169.68 | $ 169.68| Stock - 3 wks. 164.49 [ § 164.49 10 day ARO

31112 | § 311.12| Stock - 3 wks. 30159 | $ 301.59| 10 day ARO

236.46 | $ 236.46 Stock - 3 wks. 22922 | $ 229.22 10 day ARO

48833 | $ 488.33 Stock - 3 wks. 47338 | § 473.38 15 day ARO

39142 | $ 391.42| Stock - 3 wks. 379.44 | § 379.44] 15 day ARO

496.49 | $ 496.49( Stock - 3 wks. 481.30 [ § 481.30 15 day ARO

Quote Price d Price
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Annual Water System Maintenance Parts Supply 2019

Arizona Water Works (Tempe)

Core & Main (Prescott)

Dana Kepner (LHC)

Ferguson Waterworks (Phoenix)

Fortline Waterworks (Peoria)

Line # Part Class Description Unit of Measure N;f:elro Quote Price Extended Price Availability
G23 STAINLESS STEEL |REPAIR CLAMP 18" x 20" 19.10 - 19.90 EA 1 47168 | $ 471.68 7-10 days
G24 STAINLESS STEEL |REPAIR CLAMP 20" x 20" 19.90 - 21.10 EA 1 47168 | $ 471.68 7-10 days
G25 STAINLESS STEEL |REPAIR CLAMP 20" x 20"  20.95 - 22.55 EA 1 488.26 | $ 488.26] 7-10 days
G26 STAINLESS STEEL |REPAIR CLAMP 20" x 20"  21.20 - 22.00 EA 1 488.26 | $ 488.26) 7-10 days
G27 STAINLESS STEEL |REPAIR CLAMP 20" x 20" 21.60 - 22.80 EA 1 488.26 | $ 488.26] 7-10 days
G28 STAINLESS STEEL |REPAIR CLAMP 20" x 20"  22.00 - 23.60 EA 1 780.00 | $ 780.00) 7-10 days
G29 STAINLESS STEEL |REPAIR CLAMP 24" x 20" 23.50 - 25.10 EA 1 850.45 | § 850.45 7-10 days
G30 STAINLESS STEEL |REPAIR CLAMP 24" x 20"  27.40 - 28.60 EA 1 88262 | § 882.62 7-10 days
G31 STAINLESS STEEL |REPAIR CLAMP 24" x 20"  28.50 - 29.70 EA 1 88261 | $ 882.61 7-10 days
G32 STAINLESS STEEL |REPAIR CLAMP 30" x 20" 28.50 - 30.10 EA 1 1,01829 | § 1,018.29 7-10 days
G33 STAINLESS STEEL |REPAIR CLAMP 30" x 20" 29.60 - 30.80 EA 1 88262 | § 882.62 7-10 days
G34 STAINLESS STEEL |REPAIR CLAMP 30" x 20"  31.40 - 32.60 EA 1 88262 | § 882.62 7-10 days
G35 STAINLESS STEEL |REPAIR CLAMP 36" x 20"  33.00 - 34.60 EA 1 1,174.96 | $ 1,174.96 7-10 days
G36 STAINLESS STEEL |REPAIR CLAMP 36" x 20"  34.50 - 36.10 EA 1 127912 | § 1,279.12 7-10 days
G37 STAINLESS STEEL |REPAIR CLAMP 36" x 20"  36.00 - 37.60 EA 1 127912 | $ 1,279.12 7-10 days
G38 STAINLESS STEEL |REPAIR CLAMP 36" x 20" 37.70 - 38.90 EA 1 127912 | § 1,279.12 7-10 days
G39 STAINLESS STEEL |STEEL INSERTS #52 1" STIFFENER EA 1 127 | $ 1.27] 7-10 days
G40 STAINLESS STEEL (STEEL INSERTS #54 1 1/2" STIFFENER EA 1 175 $ 1.7§ 7-10 days
G41 STAINLESS STEEL |STEEL INSERTS #55 2" STIFFENER EA 30 175 $ 52.50 7-10 days
G42 STAINLESS STEEL |[TAPPING SLEEVE 6"X 6" 6.90"-7.30" EA 1 43167 | $ 431.67| 7-10 days
G43 STAINLESS STEEL |TAPPING SLEEVE 6" X6" 7.10"-7.50" EA 1 34490 | § 344.90 7-10 days
G44 STAINLESS STEEL |[TAPPING SLEEVE 8"X 6" 9.30"-9.70" EA 1 363.89 | § 363.89 7-10 days
G45 STAINLESS STEEL |TAPPING SLEEVE 10" X 6" 11.75"-12.15" EA 1 429.18 | $ 429.18 7-10 days
G46 STAINLESS STEEL (TAPPING SLEEVE 12" X 6" 14.00" - 14.40" EA 1 554.52 | § 554.52) 7-10 days
G47 STAINLESS STEEL |WRAP AROUND CLAMP 1" X6R  RANGE 1.125 EA 10 2584 | $ 258.40) 7-10 days
G48 STAINLESS STEEL (WRAP AROUND CLAMP 1" X 3R RANGE 1.125 EA 50 12.85( $ 642.50) 7-10 days
G49 STAINLESS STEEL |WRAP AROUND CLAMP 1.5" X 3R RANGE 1.625 EA 5 1353 [ § 67.65 7-10 days
G50 STAINLESS STEEL |WRAP AROUND CLAMP 1.5" X 6R RANGE 1.625 EA 1 2664 [ $ 26.64 7-10 days
G51 STAINLESS STEEL |WRAP AROUND CLAMP 2" X 3R RANGE 2.125 EA 1 1472 $ 14.72 7-10 days
G52 STAINLESS STEEL (WRAP AROUND CLAMP 2" X 6R RANGE 2.125 EA 1 2735($ 27.35 7-10 days
G53 STAINLESS STEEL |[INSERT 1 1/4" (H-6) EA 10 157 | $ 15.70) 7-10 days
G54 STAINLESS STEEL (WRAP AROUND CLAMP 1.25" X 3R RANGE 1.38  (H-6) EA 20 19.25 ( $ 385.00) 7-10 days

H1 PIPE SCHEDULE 40 - 4INCH WATERMAIN 4" X 20" White PVC FT 1,000 NO BID
H2 PIPE 4" C-900 WATER PIPE DR14 20' lengths FT 20 NO BID
H3 PIPE 6" C-900 WATER PIPE DR14 20' lengths FT 20 NO BID

(used for valves & mains) blue PVC pipe
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49649 | $ 496.49 Stock - 3 wks. 481.30 [ § 481.30 15 day ARO
496.49 | $ 496.49( Stock - 3 wks. 48130 | $ 481.30 15 day ARO
51395 | § 513.95| Stock - 3 wks. 498.21 | § 498.21 15 day ARO
513.95 | § 513.95| Stock - 3 wks. 49821 | $ 498.21 15 day ARO
51395 | § 513.95| Stock - 3 wks. 498.21 [ § 498.21 15 day ARO
821.04 | § 821.04 Stock - 3 wks. 79591 | $ 795.91 15 day ARO
895.20 | § 895.20( Stock - 3 wks. 867.80 | $ 867.80 15 day ARO
929.06 | $ 929.06 Stock - 3 wks. 900.62 | $ 900.62 15 day ARO
929.06 | $ 929.06( Stock - 3 wks. 900.62 | $ 900.62 15 day ARO

1,071.87 [ $ 1,071.87 Stock - 3 wks. 1,039.06 | $ 1,039.06 15 day ARO
929.06 | $ 929.06( Stock - 3 wks. 900.62 | $ 900.62 15 day ARO
929.06 | $ 929.06 Stock - 3 wks. 900.62 | $ 900.62 15 day ARO

1,236.79 | $ 1,236.79 Stock - 3 wks. 1,198.93 [ § 1,198.93] 15 day ARO

1,346.43 [ $ 1,346.43 Stock - 3 wks. 1,305.21 | $ 1,305.21 15 day ARO

1,346.43 [ § 1,346.43 Stock - 3 wks. 1,305.21 [ § 1,305.21 15 day ARO

1,346.43 [ $ 1,346.43 Stock - 3 wks. 1,305.21 | $ 1,305.21 15 day ARO

140 | $ 1.40] Stock 129§ 1.29| 5 day ARO
193§ 1.93 Stock 178 | $ 1.78 5 day ARO
193§ 57.90[ Stock - 3 wks. 178 § 53.40| 5 day ARO
454.38 | $ 454.38 Stock - 3 wks. 44501 | $ 445.01 5 day ARO
363.04 | § 363.04| Stock - 3 wks. 355.56 | $ 355.56 5 day ARO
383.03 | $ 383.03| Stock - 3 wks. 37513 | § 375.13] 5 day ARO
45176 | $ 451.76 Stock - 3 wks. 44244 | $ 442.44 5 day ARO
583.69 | $ 583.69| Stock - 3 wks. 571.66 | $ 571.66| 5 day ARO
3772 | $§ 377.20 Stock - 3 wks. 2631 § 263.10 5 day ARO
1352 | $ 676.00( Stock - 3 wks. 13.08 [ 654.00 5 day ARO
1423 $ 71.15 Stock - 3 wks. 13.80 [ $ 69.00 5 day ARO
28.03 | $ 28.03 Stock - 3 wks. 2717 $ 27.17| 5 day ARO
1548 [ § 15.48| Stock - 3 wks. 15.01 [ $ 15.01 5 day ARO
2878 | § 28.78 Stock - 3 wks. 2790 | $ 27.90| 5 day ARO
173 8 17.30] Stock 159 § 15.90| 5 day ARO
2138 | $ 427.60( Stock - 3 wks. 19.60 | § 392.00| 5 day ARO
436 | $ 4,360.00 204 (8 2,040.00] 5 day ARO
3.00 | $ 60.00 328($% 65.60 5 day ARO
585| $ 117.00 638 [ § 127.60 5 day ARO
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Annual Water System Maintenance Parts Supply 2019

Arizona Water Works (Tempe)

Core & Main (Prescott)

Dana Kepner (LHC)

Ferguson Waterworks (Phoenix)

Fortline Waterworks (Peoria)

Need to

Extended Price Availability

Line # Part Class Description Unit of Measure Order Quote Price
e PPE | Goad it vaves & mane) bue PYC pig. il 2 Noso
s PIPE | ired forvalvee § maine) e PYC e il 2 No s
e PIPE 12" C-900 WATER PIPE DR14 20’ lengths - 20 NO BID

(used for valves & mains) blue PVC pipe
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$ 250,154.32

Quote Price

Extended Price

57,843.83

Availability

Quote Price d Price A

Quote Price Extended Price Availability Quote Price Extended Price Auvailability
$ 10.16 203.20 10.85 217.00 5 day ARO
$ 15.76 315.20 19.18 383.60 5 day ARO
$ 22.40 448.00 27.10 542.00| 5 day ARO

275,835.63 250,616.00

$ 91,564.84
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Annual Water System Maintenance Parts Supply 2019

Arizona Water Works (Tempe) Core & Main (Prescott) Dana Kepner (LHC) Ferguson Waterworks (Phoenix) Fortline Waterworks (Peoria)
Line # Part Class Description Unit of Measure N;f:elro Quote Price Extended Price Availability Quote Price Extended Price Availability Quote Price Extended Price Availability Quote Price Extended Price Availability Quote Price d Price A
Arizona Water Works (Tempe) Core & Main (Prescott) Dana Kepner (LHC) Ferguson Waterworks (Phoenix) Fortline Waterworks (Peoria)
Category Quote Price Extended Price # ofItAev:srded Quote Price Extended Price # ofItAev:srded Quote Price Extended Price #of I’tl \Ar::xsrded Quote Price Extended Price #of I’tl \Ar::xsrded Quote Price Extended Price #of I’tl \Ar::xsrded
Brass $ 32,444.85 | $ 80,312.08 46 $ - - 0 $ 226.07 3,017.50 18
Cast Iron $ 3,279.58 | $ 43,024.08 17 $ - - 0 $ 474.10 12,493.70 10 $ -1 s - 0
FH $ -l s - 0 $ 65.46 297.30 2 $ 6,068.38 27,473.53 6 $ -8 - 0
Misc. $ 28520 | $ 3,785.00 7 $ - - 0 $ 5.31 159.30 1
Plastic $ 23471 $ 2,162.08 3 $ - - 0 $ 413.12 14,987.15 5
Rubber $ - $ - 0 $ - - 0 $ 0.41 880.00 3
Stgig:fs $ 7479 | $ 1,421.75 6 $ - - 0 $ 5.59 249.25 2
Pipe _ $ 22.40 448.00 1 $ 2.04 2,040.00 1
Subtotal $ 36,319.13 | $ 130,704.99 79 - 0 # $ 87.86 745.30 3 $ 7,195.02 61,300.43 46 #$ - |8 - 0
Sales Tax 8.5% $ 11,109.92 8.5% - 8.5% 63.35 8.5% 5,210.54 8.5% $ -
Total $ 141,814.91 - 808.65 66,510.97 $ -
Inventory Replenishment - Initial Purchase: Av;z::;ad $ 209,134.53
Arizona Water Works (Tempe) Core & Main (Prescott) Dana Kepner (LHC) Ferguson Waterworks (Phoenix) Fortline Waterworks (Peoria)
Category Unit Quote Price # OfI::“:;ded Quote Price # OfI::“:;ded Quote Price # Of&v‘rfsrded Quote Price # Of&v‘rfsrded Quote Price # Of&v‘rfsrded
Brass $ 1,937.49 0 $ - 0 $ 700.81 0
Cast Iron $ 10,658.25 0 $ - 0 $ 366.08 3
FH $ - 0 $ 42.70 1 $ 8,935.72 6
Misc. $ - 0 $ - 0 $ - 0
Plastic $ 50.07 0 $ - 0 $ 290.56 3
Rubber $ 9.08 0 $ 4.39 2 $ 1.96 0
S';it';':lss $ 19,679.65 0 $ - 0 $ 1.78 1
Pipe $ 34.77 4 $ - 0
Subtotal $ 32,334.54 0 $ 81.86 7 $ 10,296.91 13 #
Sales Tax 8.5% 8.5% 8.5%
Total $ 35,082.98 $ 61.25 $ 11,172.15
Inventory Replenishment; if required. Annual Pricing: A¥i::|ed $ 46,459.59
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